
Testimonies Chronological Gospel 2023

1-January 18, 2023

I am Susan N., mother of twelve children, and five grandchildren.  I am 62 years 
old now–a widow due to witchcraft.  Here is how it went:

Birth and Life.

I was born to the late Jacob and Tercilla who are from strong witchcraft 
background.  I stayed most of the time with my father and this made me see many 
people come to his shrine.  In this shrine, we had different gods represented, i.e 
Wajumbe, the god of death and Wamugona, the fertility goddess.

People would visit my father’s shrine and give sacrifices which to my surprise we 
would eat in the names of gods for they don’t eat, see, talk, or even do anything . . 
. but we still had to believe–nothing more, nothing less.

In the year 1980, I lost my father, but was made to inherit the shrine as I was the 
only surviving child.  I made a decree to serve [the gods] wherever I go, including 
marriage.

Marriage and death of Children

The worst thing–I continued serving and when I got married, I dedicated all my 
children to the gods of the land, as I was so much possessed with demons.  I 
offered a lot of sacrifices–not only in the shrines, but also in the graves to please 
my ancestors and their gods.

To show my love to Walumbe, the god of death, I sacrificed my firstborn and 
that’s how tragedy began in my family.  Every year I would have to offer till at last 
my husband.

Every year I would go to their graves.  I hated myself, serving the gods, offering 
my children, animals,  community members as I did all the human offering in 
secret, but animals I did publicly.

Chronological story and Salvation.

It was last year when I was lost in thoughts and hoping to die that I met these good



grandsons of mine–Mnakenya and Mnyolee (referring to Felix and Joseph).

Though people feared my house, [Felix and Joseph] would come and share with 
me from small booklets about the holiness of God, His love, and I was so much 
touched when I came to learn how [demons]  told our ancestors to slaughter their 
children.  This touched me because it was not only my ancestors, but me as well. 

At this moment, I chased them out of my house to let me be judged and 
condemned.

As they started teaching in Busolwe this year with the next lessons, I called them 
to my house to share different dreams I have been getting and to pray with me.

It was a struggle but as I prayed a burden was lifted.  I felt a great joy–my 
grandchildren are so happy that I am transformed.  Every night they read to me 
these booklets as I have loved to listen to the stories, but I don’t know how to 
read.  Though I can listen to small English, they tell me the stories in Luganda.

Thanks to the Lord Jesus Christ for accepting to die for me, and teaching me that 
He don’t need human sacrifice like my ancestors did.  I am transformed child of 
God.

Thanks for my sons Mnakenya and Mnyolee for bringing me this good news with 
love and being patient with me everyday.

These booklets are good.  Indeed, I lost my children, husband, and family but God 
has given me another family of love, peace, and joy.  My prayer is to get these 
books “talking” so I can listen everyday by myself and share with people of my 
age.

2-January 18, 2023

An old man named Kentoi Ole Selelo woke up at 4 am to be at the venue on time 
so as not to miss anything.  Despite his blindness, he tracked 10km just to come 
and hear the good news.  After listening to our teachings this is what he had to 
say:

“I thought you people had come to take pictures so that you can go and get money 
on our behalf and leave us as we are,  I thank God you are true messengers.  You 
have brought us something better, not the Mzungu [white man’s] religion, but the



truth to save us.  I may be blind, but I know God loves me.  This is why he has 
sent you to me.  God created everything good and I know I am very good in the 
eyes of God.  Please give my son one book so that he will read it to me as we go 
home.  Now I can hear from my own language.  Greet those who sent the books to 
us.  God bless you!”

3-January 20, 2023

Jane Achieng was born to parents who later divorced as the father was a Muslim 
and the mother a Christian.

“My family didn’t know peace.  My husband, Sheik Ibrahim was one of the re-
known witch consultants in Bubalia,” says Sister Tercilla  (Jane’s mother).

Since these teachings started, I learnt many things in the booklets.  One thing is 
the story of people during Noah’s time.   Noah built the ark, and his neighbors 
didn’t enter because of disobedience.

When my husband left me, due to my faith in Christ, my children choose to be 
with their father and I was left with one–Jane Achieng.  In a period of two years, 
my daughter started behaviors I couldn’t understand and then ran mad, ending up 
in the street.

Life became so challenging.  My daughter was so violent and could not want 
anyone to approach near her.  Her food she picked [out of the garbage dump].  As 
a loving mother, I kept on watching after her at a distance.

One Monday morning, I woke up, and Jane was no longer in her normal place. 
She came after five months with a pregnancy from unknown man.

I became so scared of her and the baby.  I spoke to my neighbors who helped me 
tie her with ropes and bring her home.  I was told to try out the [witch doctor] but I 
refused.  This brought more rejection and mockery.

After giving birth, my daughter left home–never to be seen again, I was a mother 
and a grandmother.  I would feed my grandchild with porridge and milk. 
Thankfully, she is now 3 years old.

While I was listening to the teachings, I learnt that all these is because of the devil



who doesn’t wish us anything good.  I shared with Felix and Joseph my problem 
and we prayed to God together.

It was on Thursday afternoon, while we were having open air crusade after sharing 
the chronological teaching in the church that from nowhere, the Lord brought my 
mad daughter to the crusade.

People prayed for her, and she gained normality.  Thanks to God, I shared this 
with Felix and Joseph to go home, to take us home, and to pray with us.

The devil has lost the battle.   Jesus has victory over my house, they assured me.

At night while I was asleep I heard a knock and was so hesitant to open, but I 
opened anyway.  I could not believe the sight of my husband kneeling down 
asking me to forgive him.  He said he has changed–that he dreamed about two 
young men going to pray with us in our family on 7th of January and the dream 
said he should come on Thursday, but due to fear, he came at night.

“I am no longer Sheik Ibrahim,” he says.  “I want a new name.”

Through teaching, Ibrahim accepted the Lord Jesus Christ.  He promised to bring 
the two children home.

What a reunion the Lord Jesus Christ brought through chronological teachings. 
Thanks for continuous support and prayer.

4-January 23, 2023

Sheikh Ibrahim shares later after the crusade, “In my life as a sheikh, all I have 
been knowing is I am sick.  I need a doctor.  The challenge–I have never been 
prepared to receive Jesus Christ.  These booklets are so good.  I have been reading 
and in one week I am filled with joy. My heart is open to the Lord and keep on 
teaching this message to the Muslim community.”

5-January 23, 2023

Sister Sausa says, “I have never thought it’s the devil telling me to disobey God.  I 
listened to the devil.  Like Noah, I have been a heavy drunkard, and have lived a 
bad life.  Thanks to God, He still shares His love with me.”



6-January 23, 2023

Pastor Peter says: “[My initial] theology made me think so wicked about the 
children of Israel.  In lesson 29, I have learnt that it is our story.  Like the children 
of Israel, we have disobeyed the Lord.  May the Lord keep on teaching us simple 
biblical truths.”

7-January 23, 2023

Pastor David had a thought and shared this with us:   “Salvation didn’t start with 
the Gospels.  We have had a weak foundation, thereby bringing a very negative 
result.  May the Lord bless you as you keep on teaching with humility.”

8-January 23, 2023

“Being a witch is idol worship.  It is worshiping Satan,” says Susan who was 
formerly a witch.

9-January 27, 2023

My name is [name withheld], am a Borana living in [name withheld] village.  Born 
and raised in a Muslim family. I have gone to madrassa [Islamic school] and have 
memorized the Quran.  I grew up knowing that Christians are our enemies.

I joined a cattle rustling group where we raided villages and stole their cattle.  The 
worst I remember is when we invaded a place in [name withheld], killed and burnt 
houses as we stole their cows.  This has remained in my mind, guilt has tormented 
me, and have always wondered if God will ever forgive me.

Am married as per the Islamic laws and have children who go to madrassa, but my 
heart has always been that I don’t want my boys to follow my background.  I have 
been asking Allah [the Islamic word for “God”] to send me someone who could 
tell me more about the coming of ISSA [Christ] to judge us as stated in the Quran.

One day on my way to the market, I met some guys who were talking about Jesus. 

My spirit told me to ask them–what they were saying–and we began talking and 
thus how I met Pastor [name withheld] who was teaching them.  I asked him if he 
could teach me the same and he gave me some books that I have been reading.



Since then, I thank God now that I know the truth,  I have given my life to Christ 
and I know he has forgiven me.  My family now is no longer Muslims.  I don’t 
want my boys to kill anyone.  I believe I am born again as Christ died for me too. 

I want to belong to the good tribe of God.  I was in darkness but I have seen the 
light.

If I am to be killed for giving my life to Christ so be it.  I will be happy in heaven 
with God and not in hell with seven virgins garnishing my teeth [from a Muslim 
belief].  Please keep praying for me as I plan to move to [another village] with my 
family.

God bless you.  Inshallah we shall meet.

10-February 11, 2023

My name is Neema Namulembe, born in Butaleja District, west Budama.  My 
Father is a strong Muslim.  He was an Imam of one of the mosques which is now 
sort of a shrine.  My mother Beatrice was a Christian woman when she got married 
to my dad, but since women have no say and can’t follow their own belief, she was 
forced to be a Muslim.

When I was born in 1990, my parents started having small disputes as my father 
would change women like daily clothes and not to be questioned as it is allowed in 
Islamic culture.  When Daddy would be asked, he would say, “As many as my 
right hand possesses.”

At the age of 15 years, I was forced into female genital mutilation and later, by my 
father, married to an old sheik of around 54 years as the fifth wife, thus 
terminating my education.  In African culture, especially Muslims and unlearned 
men, wealth (dowry) is more important than a girl’s life.

In this my new family, the other wives mistreated me.  I had no peace and thus 
resorted to addiction.  I would go out and smoke.  I hated my life and swore that I 
will never return to either back home or even to my parent’s home until both my 
unloving father and husband were dead.

In the year 2012, I was diagnosed of liver disease and since then I started battling 
with this sickness.  I have passed through many challenges, but above all 
addiction.



Being a drug addict, there is no separation with sexual sin, and men would use me,
sometimes in exchange for opium, alcohol, marijuana, and others.

In December of the year 2019, when my father died, I returned back home to stay
with my sick mother due to stress she was having.  Of course, I was still in heavy
addiction, and sometimes would cause more harm to her than good.

In 2021, I would go with my mother to the garden, but one day I was drunk,
undressed, and ran about mad, shouting words I didn’t even understand.

Thanks to our loving God, people from the church started visiting me.  But, they
condemned me for being a drug addict, and told me about hell.  When I looked at
my own life, I saw more hell than what they would tell me.  This only resulted in
telling them a slogan of drunkards in our area:  “WE ARE READY FOR HELL,
WE ARE A BIG TEAM UNITED.  WHEN WE GO TO HELL WE SHALL
URINATE AND KILL THE FIRE!!”

It was one day last year that while in my stressful mood, looking forward to help
and thinking of death, with a bottle in my hand, I approached the compound of
Joseph and Felix.

These two young men were so concerned and showed me love.  They would not
condemn me for taking alcohol while they spoke to me about their loving and holy
God.  At this point, I chose to come everyday and listen to them, but my intentions
were not positive.  I wanted someone to be my friend, a husband I could have sex
with.

They seemed to have studied me and everyday they would speak about the truth: 
Creation, Adam was in charge, and then, the fall of man.  How one fruit, one bite,
and then, all men sinned.  This touched me so much.

One day as I came, they shared with me from a story of one man called Noah and
his wine–when he got drunk.  At that point, I grew mad at them and left without a
goodbye.

Coming back, I said,   “Never ever talk of alcohol.  This has been my peace.” 
They apologized and asked me a question: “Would you love to curse your
generation, parents, and neighbors because of drunkardness?”



This pricked my heart so much.  However, they kept on reassuring me of the love 
of a holy God, who slaughtered an animal for Adam and Eve, who told the 
children of Israel to obey while in the land of Egypt, who made Moses grow in the 
land of Egypt in the palace to later save His people.  They shared about a lot of 
things, but when it came to  a story of the Son, they reminded me of the seed of the 
woman spoken and asked me, “What do you think of this?”  At this point, I left all 
drugs, but I didn’t know how.  However, I never made any decision.

On the evening of 21st January, after thinking for a long time, I called them and 
told them I would love to meet them.  After reading the booklets they gave me and 
recalling on the teachings they have been having with me, I  just cried so much.  I 
chose to ask them what should I do, for I want this loving God.  They led me to 
prayers.

I confessed my agendas to them, and asked them to pray with me so I could 
forgive my father and all that he did to me, to forgive everyone and to start living a 
holy and happy life.

Since then, they told me that I am forgiven, and reassured me that my God is more 
loving that my earthly father.  He is good and I can reach him all the time.

I am so happy that I went from a drug addict to a God addict.  Every time is prayer 
time, and encouraging other people never to give up on God.  I share the Bible 
stories in this booklets.

11-February 24, 2023

My name is Fatima.  I am saved and have given my life to Jesus Christ.  I am the 
third wife to  a Muslim man who I will not say his name.  I got married to him as a 
ransom from my father who had his debt and when he was unable to pay, I was 
given out for marriage as a substitute.

I was only fourteen years old when this happened.  It took me years to come to 
terms with this marriage.  I was seen as a nobody by my cowives and I was 
ridiculed everyday.  As a young girl, I was victimized by my husband as I had no 
say in his life.  My life has been full of pains, and I hated my father so much that 
he could compare me with kes. 1000/=  ($7.88).

The worst came when I got pregnant and bore a baby girl.  This didn’t go well as



my husband wanted a baby boy.  I was denied food for days so that I could die of
hunger.  I remember calling Allah several times, but nothing changed.

One day I went to the market to beg for food, and on my way I heard Christians
singing.  I decided to get and try their God.  I didn’t bother if my husband would
see me and kill me.

After the singing, there were teachings by a pastor they had invited from Marsabit.
He read stories of how we were all sinners and that God sent His son to take our
place. This struck me as I was also given out to replace money.

My hunger and pains went away for some time.  I wanted to know more, as he
continued about how He was nailed on the cross, how He was spitted on, how they
tore His clothes.  This made me cry as this was what I was going through.

The Pastor shared how Jesus came to his own and they rejected him, and I
remembered how my dad chased me out of home one day.  I came to tell him what
I was going through.  That day I left the church wondering where Jesus was so I
could talk to him.

Two days later, I went to the church and I gained courage to ask the pastor if I
could talk to the Jesus he was teaching about the other day.  The pastor looked at
me.  Maybe he thought I was mad, but I told him I wanted to talk to Jesus.

The pastor took me to the office where he shared more with me about Jesus.  He
asked me if I knew how to read and he gave me some books that I started to read
in Borana.  I would hide them under my mattress and through the whole night I
read them

Jesus talked to me through the books.  I met Pastor Moffat after three months and
he led me to give my life to Jesus.  Since then, my life has been peaceful.  I have
forgiven my husband and my dad.  I gained courage and told my husband I am a
Christian.  I was shocked that he did not react badly but he told me to follow what
I thought was right.

I give God all the glory that I met a family that values me in the church.  Thank
you for the books Pastor Moffat gave me.  I read the stories to my kids every day
as now I can’t hide them.  My husband came one day and found me reading them
and he has allowed us to read them openly.



My husband married two other wives.   We are now five and so he has no time to 
follow up what we are doing.  I thank God for my co-wife who has joined me and 
now we go to church together  Pray for us that we will follow Christ.

Fatima.

12-March 8, 2023

From the leader of the PAG church denomination in Kenya:

“We are so grateful for the truth that has been revealed to the church and the body 
of Christ in East Africa.  Chronological  lessons have changed our church.  Our 
pastors’ perspectives about the Gospel have changed and many souls have given 
their lives to Christ.  From the testimonies we receive, families have been 
strengthened, reconciled, and restored to the truth.  The truth has set many free 
from bondage.

It’s because of this that we requested 4,500 copies of lessons 69-80.  These books 
are going to be multiplied by 20 as we have asked each pastor to make 20 copies 
each more for their churches.  This will in turn be 900,000 books that will reach 
out to our churches.  We value these resources and we hope to have these 
teachings repeated again from lesson 1 next year.  As usual the church already has 
the KES 900,000/shillings  to pay for the down payment as agreed and we hope to 
have these ready soonest.”

13-March 14, 2023

Dear Friends, I give God all the glory that the food arrived safely.

Pastor David (a Maasai pastor) came for the food himself after there was fighting 
in the village that couldn’t allow me to go.  I thank God for the truck that we had 
paid refunded the money and we had to pay for the car that David came with.

What God’s purpose for this journey am yet to understand.  Pastor David was 
given a police man armed with a rifle to escort him.  Though not a Christian yet, 
he was willing to know this God that provided food for the village.  This is the 
only time the village has received any help from anybody or organization.  Even 
the Kenyan government has never sent any food to the village.  Our generous 
gesture has turned the village to want to know who this Enkai (God)  who sent



them food is   (The earthly government could not provide but the heavenly
government did provide).  I believe God has a plan for all that is happening.  All
Glory belong to Him.

Pastor David sent greetings to all who gave and so grateful to God for providing
for them. Mungu awabariki saana.

14-March 20, 2023

From Bithian:

“When I began reaching out to street girls I didn’t know that God had a greater 
vision for me.  I despised myself.  Little did I know that God had chosen me to 
serve Him.  Every time I enter a school at the gate my heart skips a bit, but as I 
enter a voice speaks to me, ‘Bithian you will do it’ and yes I have done it.”

God has opened up more schools for the teaching and more girls are giving their 
lives to Christ.  The need for a Savior in our schools to build a generation that will 
worship the true God and live a Christ like life is my desire.”

So far we have distributed 500 books of lessons 1-10 to five schools with each 
school having 100 books. [We also have] 500 books of lessons 11-20 in the seven 
schools that we started with.”  (She is working in twelve schools.

 Please pray for teachers who are embracing the lessons that God will use them 
even more.  Pray for the Girls who have given their lives to Christ that God will 
sustain them in His Salvation.  As more schools come on board I need more books. 
Please pray for provision for another 300 books for lesson 1-10 and 300 books 
lessons 11-20.  Pray that as I share with the students God will keep me humble and 
focused to His calling.

A Testimony from One of the Girls:

“I am the third born in our family.  My elder sister got married at the age of 14 
years.  This was due to the frustrations that we were going through.

Our father was a brutal man.  He could come home drunk and beat anyone without 
any mistakes.  My mother decided to go back to her parental home and they 
divorced.  We have been living with our uncles since then.



My mum has done all sorts of jobs to ensure we get food and school fees for me 
and my younger siblings.  I have been studying, yes, but I have never had peace of 
mind and heart, as I kept asking myself if our lives will ever get better.

I have been so bitter with my father who married another woman and has never 
bothered about us. I have kept bitterness in me that I do not even talk nor greet 
him when we meet.

When I started to study these books, I began to see a different perspective of life. 

I knew I needed a Savior to change my life and change my attitude towards my 
father.  The more I read the books, the more I know I need Christ in my life.

I want to be a good girl, I want to be of the good tribe of God.  I want to have life 
with Jesus and I know he will be there for me through my education.  After I knew 
that God has forgiven me, I have forgiven my Dad too and I hope to meet
him soon as I get the chance.  Just pray for me to be strong in Christ.”   Naomi.

15-March 23, 2023

Mama Jane

Before meeting the chronological teaching team, I didn’t know anything except 
working as a sex worker after being separated from my husband as I couldn’t 
watch sexual abuse and even rape from a man I expected would be loving me.

The church and pastors kept on abusing me, and looking at me as the worst sinner 
in the whole world who even Jesus Christ couldn’t save through His death on the 
Cross.

When I met these brothers, they shared with me the booklets and for the first time 
I found love in men proclaiming God’s Word to me.

The hardest point to me is to stop looking for men to be my hope, though I 
believed in Christ, I was still not ready to trust Him with my finances and two 
children, Mary and Jane.

One day, while reading the booklets and seeing how the Lord provided an animal 
skin for Adam and Eve’s nakedness to be covered, this touched me that God could 
also cover my sin and forgive me.



After two months of struggling to let off go of addiction, I learnt in me that I don’t 
have to struggle alone because I can’t save myself just like Adam and Eve couldn’t 
save themselves, and being born out of Garden of Eden I am a sinner and needing 
a Savior.

I would thank God He provided me work to work as a chef in a restaurant, and 
through this I am able to pay my rent, take care of my children and schools fees.

I encourage someone over there, that God is so loving and He can still remove you 
from any addiction be it masturbating, sexual addiction, drug abuse, 
unforgiveness. And all these.

“Indeed what God cannot do [does not] exist.”

16-March 30, 2023

Mzee Peter Lebom, from Kajiado is one of them that has received the light. He is 
the first person I met on my first trip to Maasai land... 

“I have been herding all my life.  I have believed in having more and more cows 
that you are blessed and in good books with God.  I believed that God loves me 
thus why he had given me cows and I would go to heaven for taking care of God’s 
animals.

I didn’t know I need a savior and not cows to enter heaven.  Yes, I can read that 
from the books you gave me that Only Jesus is our true Savior.”

17-April 3, 2023

From the Meru tribe, Pastor Nicholus Murungi from Isiolo had this to say.  “I am 
65 years old and have been in ministry for over 26 years now.  I went to a Bible 
school and most of what I was taught there has never been helpful to me in my 
service.  All I was told is to teach people the Word without knowing the 
foundation of the Word.  Today, I am leaving this [teaching] with the knowledge 
of how I should present the Gospel to the people.  Our bench mark is God.  God’s 
standard that leads to Christ and our Helper Holy Spirit.  I have seen these books 
with some of my Borana friends, but I didn’t know how sweet they are.  Simple 
but with a profound foundation of our salvation.  I need these books for my 
Church.”



18-April 3, 2023

Pastor Elias Mutei from Karatina  “These teachings have come at the right time 
with the current confusion in churches and where pastors are selfish looking for 
money.  It’s time we need to get back to the truth.  Only God is good and we all 
have fallen short of His Glory.  We need to help our churches know we are 
sinners, even as we are as pastors.  We have failed the standard of God.  We 
preach heresy and not the true foundation of our faith.  This is the foundation of 
our faith.  The true need of salvation for a Savior who can bring us back to the 
Lord.  Let’s teach these [booklets] to our People.”

19-April 3, 2023

Pastor Nancy Wamboi from Thika: “In college, I learned how to critique and 
support already written documents that had no foundation like what we are 
learning today.  Many times we make altar calls, and we see hands raised.  We 
rejoice that souls have been won, but have we taught them the truth?  I feel we 
have to repent as pastors for we have not done what is required of us.  Let’s not 
waste time now that we have been enlightened.  Let’s hit the road running and 
share this gold to our congregation.  Christ loves us.  This is why we have these 
great teachings.”

20-April 11, 2023

Here is the note from South Sudan:

Our brother in Christ Rev Wycliffe, we thank God for you always.  You have 
helped enlighten our people from darkness.  As you know it is the Ramadan period 
and many people here are fasting, hoping to get help from Allah who they don’t 
know or have a personal relationship with.

To us it has been a great time to share with our friends who can read Arabic 
Arabic alphabets.  It is our Joy when we share the truth with others and as you 
always remind us, it is God who stirs their hearts to salvation.

We had a great [teaching] in AL Kur where we had 20 Muslims who attended all 
through and we gave them the booklets and they kept asking questions which we 
tried to answer as the Holy Spirit led.  We believe we planted the truth in them.



We thank God for the pastors in Talodi who are sharing this with The SPLM 
ravels who want to know more about Christ.  We have had several who have given 
their lives to Christ from this bush area.  One of the sweet things about the books 
is that it speaks to people in their language.  In Nuer we have had cry after 
knowing the truth and going back to their families again and this gives glory to 
God.

Brother we will be in Nairobi on 24th April,   Please, we don’t want to stop this 
move.  Kindly help us carry some more lessons back home.

We would  greatly appreciate it if we can get 500 of Nuer lessons 43-68 and 500 
of Arabic Arabic  lessons 43-68.  We will come with empty suitcases to stock in. 
Once again, thank you so much for being part of the Lord’s work in Nuba 
mountains.  God bless you.

Pastor Mubarrak

21-April 17, 2023

Being a Dinka Madang--It’s true we love prestige and pride.  My name is Guwo.  I 
came from South Sudan, due to the Dinka- Nuer tribal/ political war.  I was a 
soldier, and my aim as a captain was to see the Nuer tribe swept flat and none 
remaining.

This war did cost me a lot including separation from my own family, and later, I 
learned of the death of my children.  The worst enemy of life is war, and as long as 
we live, we should always learn that life is war.  It’s so much war that nothing can 
stop except someone who has Jesus.

In early 2000, I ran into Uganda just for the sake of my peace and chose to be a 
refugee in Adjumani.  However, the devil could still use me more and more.  I 
started speaking to myself and became very hostile. 

In 2011, I said enough to [refugee] camp life and kept on walking until I was 
welcomed in Oruwamuge in a Abim District.  I had developed a serious cough and 
I would sometimes cough blood, a very dry and painful cough.  Because I needed 
freedom, I chose to start [to work in building construction] because I had learnt 
that, and this gave me a little income, but with difficulties due to frequent ailments



All this time, no one could come and share with me God’s love, and I was ready to 
die.  I hated my life.  Others said that I had TB, and they would not associate with 
me.  When this team came to Abim, they gave out  booklets written in English. 

Since I was doing nothing much, I would be in the house for a long time, reading 
[the booklets] and telling God, “If only I could find my family to bury me.”

[The team] kept on praying with me and I am saying God answers prayers.  The 
cough is gone and two weeks ago, my wife traced me and found me.  We’re 
happily re-united, and ready to go back to South Sudan, and serve as peace 
ambassadors between my tribe and the Nuer.

I am old now at 56 years but the Lord is my strength. Thanks so much for the 
chronological teachings.  What a blessing.

James Guwo

22-April 20, 2023

News letter from Pastor George.  I greet you all in the name of the Lord Jesus.

I hope you’re well in Him and blessed through His life, death, resurrection, and 
second coming.

I am Pastor George Wadimi, a Senior Pastor of PAG Karamoja Region. I have the 
same privilege to be the chairman of the Pastors fellowship in Karamoja region.

I /We have been struggling with leaders, finding a solution to our challenges has 
never been easy.  There has always been dispute in doctrinal issues, and this has 
led us to be scared of any training/new teachings in this region.  God bless you, 
David, Bright, and Joseph.  You’re indeed humbled soldiers of Christ.

Four months ago, it reached my office from Obolokome PAG of a new teaching 
branded Chronological Bible Teachings . Such name has been so big to me and I 
knew yet another loosing of leaders.  It’s true our issues has been leadership 
struggles and everyone wanting to be heard.

Not until three little young men, fervent for the Lord, ready to serve Him in this 
condition reached with the study booklets.  These young men are so fervent and 
would sleep hungry sometimes as this is a very dry ground and hunger strikes, 
whenever there was food, we would share together and “Christ laid down His life,



who am I to refuse laying down mine if am His disciple.”

Always Bright would encourage our team. I love the ego and grace in the teaching. 

I love seeing young men genuinely scrolling on the ground and praying over a 
blood thirst Karamoja Region.  This place is full of blood of warriors.  Some have 
been burnt alive.  Some have been cut into small pieces just like firewood.  My 
God,  I am sorry I feel so much touched and a fresh breath in me to see what the 
Lord is doing, through crusades and teachings.

Chronological teaching is a book to be embraced, self learnt, and never dream of 
keeping this booklet and knowledge therein to yourself.  To the ministry 
supporters, may the Lord bless you, may you never lack and always thanks for 
opening your arm to the unengaged land of Karamoja.

23-May 8, 2023

Pastor Okello from Oriri AIC Church:

“This is the best seminar I have attended because it has helped me understand how 
to share the good news with my flock.  I am now able to share nothing but the 
truth of God in a very simple way.  I now know the importance of the foundation 
in sharing God’s Word, as the Word is God Himself.”

24-May 8, 2023

Pastor Maurice Odume of Migori Methodist church:

“How long has this system existed?  I wish I knew of these before I became a 
pastor.  My work would have been easier, but I thank God we have it now, for 
now is the Lord’s time.  People are perishing for lack of knowledge.  Pastors 
preach heresy for lack of knowledge.  Our churches are going to change as we are 
going to go back to the beginning and help our people know God and not pastors. 
We have taken God’s position in the Gospel, yet these books teach us that it 
begins with God and ends with God.  I am really sorry and I hope God forgives me 
for not teaching His people His way.”

25-May 8, 2023

Pastor Kevin Obiero, of Katitu ACK Church:



“This is a second chance the Lord has given us to do what is right.  To teach His 
people the truth His way.  God inspired people to write the Bible, His word, His 
way and so as pastors we are to teach God’s word, God’s way and I believe this is 
God’s way.  I have seen the light to my preaching and teaching. The foundation of 
the Gospel in the Old Testament and its fulfilment in the New Testament.  It’s time 
for us to save Kenyans from the Lake of Fire and bring them back to God by 
teaching them this way.”

26-May 12, 2023

Matthew chapter 28 verses 18 to 19 has been my favorite verse.

I want to thank God who is enabled me to meet a beautiful team.  I’m Brother 
Josiah.  I have been doing missions in different parts of the country but with less 
knowledge on how to share the lovely Word.

It is always good to share the word of God, there has been a rise of cult 
information today.  This is due to wrong teaching which have brought wrong 
beliefs and the foundation has been weak.  In my last attendance of chronological 
class, I realized that God’s holiness must always be the foundation of our teaching. 
Every believer needs to know that God is holy, and He punishes all sin by death.

Many ministers have spoken about the grace of God while living His holiness and 
this has brought up a church which does not fear sin.  Compromise is a problem 
today.  I thank God that the fellowship is growing with a doctrine that is based on 
the foundation of God.

The entire church needs to listen to these teachings, embrace them and walking 
them through their Christian life.

From 1 to lesson 68, it has been a nice time to study.   Hearts have been 
challenged and simplicity has been known.  My walk will change henceforth, my 
approach of study is Chronological from now.  That’s why I pray that the 
chronological teaching will go on.  Thank you for loving Uganda.  Thank you 
for loving Iganga.  Thank you for loving us.

Remaining humble yet with great teaching has made this team to be an explicit.  I 
would love listening to you more and more my dear brothers.  Remain humbled 
and serve the Lord in humility for that is the way to go.



I will always help you on chronological teaching throughout my area with dignity 
and love.  Brother Josiah        

27-May 12, 2023

I want to thank God for this testimony.  I share to the Glory of God.

“Formerly I was a persecutor of the church.  I was a Muslim and also a witch for 
my religion to prosper.  I used charms for everything to go on well.

One day while having debates in Iganga district (Uganda), a prominent debate 
ground, I was called to the podium and instead of greeting ‘Asaalam Alaikum’ (a 
Muslim greeting), I greeted,  ‘Praise Jesus.’  This was the beginning of my 
persecution.

With great anger, they removed me up and took me inside the house.  It was such a 
confusing moment for me.  Immediately, I heard a voice calling me, ‘Sulait! 

Sulait!  Sulait!  Be strong.  It’s not all about you, but about me.  Be strong and 
have no fear.  I have chosen you and you are therefore mine!’

My people came in plus other Muslims, and started beating me up, called me all 
sort of names, and accused me of Shirk, the most unforgivable sin in Islam.  My 
mother was asked what to be done to me and then she said anything as long as I 
remain a Muslim, even if it means death, torture, or even imprisonment.

My father and mother agreed that I should be put to prison and therefore my 
uncles and the clans plus other Muslims took me in.  For the next three months, 
my life was hell.  I suffered under persecution–what the police could do to me was 
horrible.

They were Muslim policemen and well paid to torture me.  They did their work. 

For the first two weeks, they burnt my hands with hot water and 50 strokes with a 
cane every day.  This destroyed my fingers, and I can no longer do hard labor.

One day, something horrible happened.  They came to inquire whether I have 
changed and ready to accept Islamic religion again, which I told them, “No!”  At 
this moment, they mixed a glass of water with poison and another one without 
poison, and brought it to me so that I can choose one to drink.



If [I would drink] the one of poison, it means Jesus has no power and I will
definitely die.  Immediately, when I stretched out my hands, the cup with poison
fell down and I was surprised.  Brethren, God is faithful and will always rescue his
people.  What He cannot do does not exist.  He helped me.

This was not enough.  They kept on making me suffer.  What can I say, but God
was on my side.  My family refused to accept me, and I was rotting in prison.  My
mother rejected me and many times told me that I’m a reject.

In prison, God transformed me, but I still [liked?] a lot.  Fear was my bread.  I was
looked down upon, but one day a policeman came in and inquired why I have been
there for three months.  Is it true that I was wasting money on ladies as my file was
indicating?  I replied boldly, ‘No!’  I have been a Christian and that is my crime I
told him.

At this moment, the Lord was reminding me of the things I have been doing [in my
previous life] like killing people,  My previous life was the life of drinking blood
and going underwater.  I couldn’t eat any food.  I grew so thin.  Witchcraft, all the
blood I was drinking, and all the medicine I was using could not save me.

To this day, I have marks on my hands–two of these.  One from the satanic shrine
and another one from the beatings and torture in the prison.

I have moved so many places to find a solution, but no solution was found for me
until one day I decided to attend the chronological Bible teaching while in Iganga. 
It was so touching to understand that the devil had stolen me and was busy taking
me to hell.  Our God is a faithful God.  He doesn’t forsake his own.

While teaching was going on, I felt the power of the Holy Spirit and I fell down.
My heart was broken.  My ego was gone.  There is nobody like Jesus.  He
transforms lives and gives hope to the hopeless.

Today I live a life in Christ thanks to the chronological teaching.  Thanks to Jesus,
He has changed me.  He still ministering to me.

Immediately, I no longer wanted my name,  I requested my name to be changed,
and after prayers, I was given the name Joseph.  I have a new name, my sins are
forgiven, and I am going to heaven by being a child of God.  I am loved by God. 
With God everything is possible and I love always that.



What God cannot do does not exist.  What God cannot change is never there. 
What God cannot heal has never been.  Who God cannot use is not there. 

Glory to God in the highest.  From a child of the devil to a child of God.  From 
Sulait to Joseph.”

28-May 15, 2023

“I believed in a traditional god called Jehovah Wanyonyi.  I got married to a man 
in Kitale who took me to this church.  We have served in this church until my 
husband died.

The death of my husband opened a lot of questions in my heart.   In his sickness. 
we had gone to our pastor for prayers.  All he told us is that our ancestors were 
angry with us and that we have to sacrifice.   We gave first a goat, then a sheep, 
and finally a cow, but my husband died.  During his burial, the shameful pastor 
again claimed that the death of my husband was the anger of the ancestors and that 
I needed to now sacrifice our son.  This broke my heart.  I couldn’t lose a husband 
and a son at the same time.  NO!

Before I could make any decision, my elder son was attacked by unknown people 
and almost killed.   I decided to look for another way.  I visited Malakisi ADC 
church.  I explained my problem to the pastor and he asked me to attend the 
teaching that will help me know the truth.

I have been attending the church teachings every Sunday and now I understand 
God can not allow us to sacrifice our own as he already has given a sacrifice–His 
son for us.   If God sacrificed a lamb for Adam and Eve, He can do the same for 
us.  God sacrificed a lamb instead of Isaac.

My son will not die.  He is healed and now attends the teachings with me.  God 
heard the cries of the Israelites in darkness in Egypt.  It is my prayer that God will 
hear the cries of those who are lost in Jehovah Wanyonyi’s church and send these 
books to them too.  I was lost, but these books have saved me and my son from 
human sacrifices that don’t save us.   I now know the truth.”

29-May 17, 2023

From Fiona Rahedi, a woman pastor in Uganda who is checking the Luganda



translation of the chronological teaching:

“I love reading books, and in my service, I have also read the Bible.  When I first 
saw the booklets with brother Wycliffe, I felt they were for primary school and as 
a former teacher, W wanted to do the checking for the students.

I did not know they were these deep, yet sooo simple.  This is the Bible explained 
in whole. Things that were nothing to me now make sense as I read these booklets. 

I am being edified as I read and [correct them].  These are the best I have come 
across.  Every Ugandan needs these booklets.  I am humbled to be part of the 
revival of truth in Uganda. [I am sending the first ten].  They are wonderful.  I 
hope to have the rest soonest.”

30-May 17, 2023

From George Natwa in Iganga, Uganda:

“Praise the Lord.  I am great full for the previous lessons that you’ve been having 
with us in Iganga.  While sharing, I understood many things but above all, there is 
what has captivated my heart in the chronological teachings. 

I have been seeking the Lord Jesus to find someone who loves Him and would 
share His word with humility and be sincere of heart.

Had I met you earlier, I would be so far in sharing.  I have been sharing but full of 
pain of what has been taking place in my family.  I blamed people who always 
could come for fellowship, but after a week, they have gone back.

I had a weak foundation.  I didn’t share genuinely.  I was so proud and very 
impatient. 

Thanks for chronological teaching throughout.  Now, I am seeing a great change. 
My life has changed.  Now I handle things differently and I am having positive 
results.

Thanks unto God for using you to minister.  The entire team has been a humble 
team.  I am deeply in love with what the Lord  is doing.”

31-May 23, 2023



“I am Mary Mwende born in Kitui, Kenya.  I am a young lady of  22  years old.   I
was raised by a single parent.  Though my father is alive, I have never met him.

I have been fellowshipping with Full Gospel Church in Magongo, Mombasa
County, Kenya.  Though I went to church, the trauma that I suffered with my mom
was eating me slowly by slowly.  I asked myself so many questions:  “God, why
me!”   “What did I do to be treated like this?”

In school, due to depression, I saw my life as hell.  In all my books, I would write
two words:  HELL and DEPRESSION.  They are real.

My life has been so loathsome and sad to me.  Many times I have thought of
committing suicide, but I did not know how best to do it.  Under stress and
insulted from all sides, I started drinking and sleeping with men.   Last month,
after missing my period, I tested myself and found out that I am pregnant. 

I did not want to think that I needed this life again.  I do not even know the man
who made me pregnant.  The man that I thought was the one also rejected me.

When a trucker was moving to Uganda, I lied to him, telling him that I lost a
friend in Uganda.  He carried me to Uganda.  The place was unknown to me
because it was my first time. 

I sat all by myself on the roadside, thinking of the last breath I would take before
throwing myself under a passing vehicle so that I could die. 

While thinking of this, a young man came to my side.  His first words caused me
to break out crying.  He said, ‘Young girl, you are loved so much!  God loves you,
and He is willing to change you if that’s what you want.’

I started weeping and at that moment, he held me in his arms, tears rolling down.  I
have never ever been hugged by anyone.  It was a dream.  His name was Felix
Bright.

He invited me to a friend’s house to stay and he would check on me almost every
day by phone or during the time we would study the Bible.

These booklets have given me hope.  It’s true.  The enemy, the devil and all of his



demons want me dead and all other people dead.  My life is changed.  I feel a 
sense of belonging.  I no longer think of abortion or suicide.  I am loved.

I say depression is real, but love is even more real.

Being part of the family of God, I am forgiven, loved, and am walking a new walk. 

Pray with me that I’ll get back to school and finish my courses.  Thanks for the 
chronological teaching.    Mary,”

32-June 2, 2023

In Nakalama, a new believer, David Waigolo who lives in Uganda, shares his joy:

Being part of the chronological teaching, I have learnt the great faithfulness of a 
great God.

Deception has been used as a tool to destroy God’s people.  As I was previously 
working for the government of Uganda, there were secrets I knew.  Many of the 
government leaders go to witchcraft for protection and power.

As a captain of the troops, I was very much a part of the fighting.  I have seen 
many wars like the one fought by the so called Kony of northern Uganda.

When it comes to fighting, the devil doesn’t want any good thing with God’s 
people.

Many things I did to protect myself from dying in the sorties out in the bush.  I 
have eaten the flesh of people who were killed in the battles, raping many women 
and even young girls.  I deserved death.  I have often fallen sick and I was

just waiting for my death.  Cigarettes have take over my life, and my internal 
organs are destroyed.

One day, while I was in a  hospital bed, I believe that God gave me a dream.  I saw 
people dying with guns, and I also saw a young man coming to me in the hospital 
bed, sharing with me the news about Jesus.  Although I never wanted to hear about 
Him, He immediately showed me a cross.  I saw His bleeding hands and He was 
calling me to Himself.

While this young man was still talking to me, he told me what the devil does:
‘Satan is a liar.  He hates all people.  He hates God, and now He wants all people



go to hell.’

I wept while in the dream, and the next day, a young man came to the hospital and 
shared the very message in the dream through some booklets. He gave me a copy 
of all the booklets, prayed with me, and told me of the love of God.

After one week I was discharged, and David came to check on me.  Thanks for the 
chronological team and the entire church for allowing a man who knew nothing 
except death, hatred and jealousy to become a child of God.

33-June 2, 2023

From Mama Raphael in Uganda:

“My marriage was been trouble.  Even though I was born again, my new character 
did not show anything of the sort to my husband.  My marriage was breaking up in 
front of my own eyes.  My husband became a drunkard, and he would come home 
very late.

God is so great and faithful, and as I listened to the teaching, this enabled me to 
understand the role of a woman.  Now, my husband is enjoying our marriage.

God is really indeed faithful and good to them that seek him diligently.  The 
family of God is a blessing, and both young and old are sharing the Word of God.”

34-June 5, 2023

Testimony of Pastor Jérémie Kankisingi from Bukavu, Congo:

“I thank the Lord for the significant progress in the activities of the members of 
my community in relation to the first distribution of the chronological study 
booklets.  Encouraging testimonies are beginning to reach us from just about 
everywhere we have sent booklets.

The children’s ministry is also progressing well. The importance of these 
teachings contained in the booklets as well as the interest shown by the children in 
reading the booklets has inspired us to consider incorporating these teachings into 
their religion class.



Indeed, most of the children come from villages and families with little faith.  It is, 
therefore, necessary to lead them to the way of the Lord.  As the Bible says in 

Proverbs 22.6 “Instruct a child in the way he should go; and when he grows up or 
old, he will not turn away from it.”

Currently we have approximately 20,000 students in our schools and more than 
30,000 faithful in our churches across the country.  The pastors who had been with 
us at the Bukavu seminar in November 2022 received one hundred booklets of the 
first ten lessons and one hundred booklets of lessons 11-20.  They gave them out 
and we’re starting to get good testimonies.

The need for booklets being great, we need to have many more.  To start, we want 
to have 2,500 booklets in French and 1,500 in Swahili (lessons 1-20).  We hope to 
produce them at the same price as before.  We thank all these people of God who 
allow us to have these booklets for the glory of our God.

35-June 5, 2023

Testimony from Bunyakiri, Congo:

“The history of my life here on earth.  Before I believed in the Lord Jesus Christ, 
I was bad for everything.  When I was 15 years old, I decided to be a rebel soldier.

I entered the forest to join bandits for torturing people and looting their property.  
I did not see any good in anyone.

On May 2, 2023, I was in the mood for a walk.  I met one of God’s servants, pastor 
Samuel Enakasheshea.  I thought of arresting him, but then he asked me where I 
was going.  I replied that I was on a walk.

It was a sign from God and I felt a fire in my heart.  Pastor Kasha gave me a book 
that had lessons 1-10.  I returned to the place where I was staying, and I continued 
to read the book.  I came to a sentence that said that God’s message is very 
important.  That night I did not sleep, and I continued to study God’s Word which 
spoke of my sins.

Later, I saw Pastor Samuel again.  He preached once again the Word of God.  I 
asked a question: “Pastor, can I be accepted by God again?”



The pastor read God’s Word to me in John 3:16-20, and I felt His truth again in 
my heart.  Since that hour, my life has changed through this book, and guided by 
Pastor Samuel.  I have repented of my sins.  I am now a new creature in Jesus.

My great joy is to see that I am accepted into the family of God.  Many in His 
family are those who suffered from me when I was a soldier with the warriors of 
war.  I thank God that they have forgiven me and accepted me with great love.

36-June 5, 2023

From Pastor Samuel Enakashesha of the Bunyakiri church in Congo:

“I thank God for all the great things he has done for our church here in Bunyakiri. 

The books which were given to us by Pastor Benjamin from the United States have 
been teaching us about having a foundation of faith, but also teaching us that the 
best message is God’s Word.

We say thank you to the author of these books, and may God give him strength for 
a great work.  He has the Word of God in these books.

The benefits we found in these books.

We have found many people who have come to believe in the Word of God here in 
Bunyakiri by teaching these books.  People have been saved and have left their 
bad ways.  It has brought changes to their foundation in both their physical and 
spiritual lives.  Many of them are now in God’s family.

We are requesting that you would add more such books in order to reach the 
people who are so many.”

37-June 5, 2023

Translated from French:

“My life was undesirable here on earth.  I was baptized by Catholic priests,

and started drinking alcohol right at my baptism party.  From that time, my whole 
life was changed.  Any money that I had, I spent on beer.  Sometimes. I never 
made it home, spending the nights, in bars, club, in the street, and even sleeping in 
the gutters.



My life was so difficult that I couldn’t even manage to buy clothes, wanting to 
steal from others.  I started taking drugs like my friends on the street.  Marijuana 
and alcohol were my usual food.  I even forgot my family and my parents did not 
even know me as their child.

At the age of twenty, I had no idea what I was doing in life.  I knew not my family. 

I walked around with several wounds on my body, not even knowing where they 
came from because of drugs.

One day, a man met me on the street, and started talking to me about stories from 
the Bible.  I did not want to listen, as I was deeply disappointed with life.  He 
insisted, however, and I asked him to come another day, believing that he would 
not come back.

He left a book with me, and I read it that night.  It talked about the history of the 
Israelites and the love of God towards his people.  While reading, I started to cry.

The next day, the man came back and started talking to me about the love of God 
and the forgiveness of sin that is in his son Jesus Christ.  I asked him if I could 
also be forgiven by this God and he replied that God loves me.

I was convinced that my life was going to change, even in spite my sins, and I 
decided to give myself to Christ.  Now, my whole life has changed and I am 
already a child of God as his servant told me.

My joy is immense because I already belong to the good tribe of God.

I thank God for his servant David and the books he gave me.  I cherish them 
much.”

38-June 5, 2023

From Wycliffe visiting the work among the Maasai:

“On my visit, I met with different pastors from different denominations who are 
using the booklets.  They all have praises to God for these booklets.

One of the pastors said this:   ‘Knowing God is the beginning of true life.  God is 
the creator and so He has the manual of our life,  No one can tell us how to live 
except for God.  It is through the Bible that God speaks.  These books speak to us



and help us hear what God says.  Through them, we also know who God is and 
how he wants us to live.  We now have the foundation of our salvation.’

I encouraged the pastors to teach themselves the books before they share them 
with others.  This will impact their lives also.”

39-June 5, 2023

From Wycliffe visiting the work in the north of Kenya:

“From Narok, I went to Garissa  where I met with Pastor Moffat who works 
among the Boranas.  Whatever God has started, He will accomplish,  Moffat has 
gone to villages that have no churches and he has been teaching people in the 
bush.

Like the Maasai, the Boranas are pastoralists and they move searching for pasture 
for their animals.  Pastor Moffat is going on well.  So far, he has taught several 
Muslim families who have given their lives to Christ as well as invitations from 
churches to teach them the chronological lessons.  He is planning to cross the 
border into Somalia in pursuit of the Boranas who live there in the border towns.

40-June 7, 2023

From a school girl in Kapsobet, Kenya:

“My name is Mary Vulimu.  I am in Form Three West.  I came to this school two 
years ago.  I have never had peace with my teachers as I have been struggling with 
my reading.  I didn’t understand any book the teachers gave me to read

Last year we began to study these booklets.  At first, I thought it would be just the 
same as the others, but “No,” this has been the turning point of my life.  God has 
used these books:

First, to help me know I have a Savior and that my life needs Him. Secondly, after 
reading the simple English used in the books, I began to understand what I was 
reading.  I applied the same reading in other subjects and now I understand what I 
read!

My grades have improved and now I am at peace with both my teachers and my



parents.  I now also know God and I have given my life to Him.

41-June 7, 2023

This is a testimony from a Borana in northern Kenya:

“I (name withheld).got married to a very beautiful woman.  God blessed us with 
three children.  I would go out to take care of our cows, and every time I came 
home I would find my wife unhappy.  I wanted to know why and everyone I asked 
did not know the reason.  I kept on like this for months and this started to stress 
me.  I was afraid for the lives of my children

I took time off and decided that I would not go back out with the animals until I 
learned the truth.  I learned that my wife had been fed with stories that I was 
cheating on her, that I had married another wife, and that I was spending my days 
with another woman–that I was lying to her.

I confronted my wife about it and she told me that this is what other people had 
told her.  This is why she had come to hate me.

As a Muslim, we are allowed to marry many wives, but  I had vowed to stay with 
my one wife.  This really broke my heart that my wife would believe these lies.

Days passed and I decided that it was time to follow the Islam rules and divorce 
her and marry another wife.  

It was during this time that I met my Christian friend.  I shared with him what I 
was going through, and he invited me to attend a study they were having.  To kill 
my boredom, I agreed.

When I found them reading some bible stories in my mother tongue, I enjoyed the 
stories so much that I forgot about my divorce and continued to attend the 
teachings.  A few months later, I discovered that I needed a true Savior in my life 
and in my marriage.

I gave my life to Christ, went home, and started reading the books with my 
children.  My wife would pretend not to pay attention to what I was reading, but I 
knew that she was listening.  Everyday, we would read the stories together.



After reading about the love of God to His people even when they disobeyed, I 
told my wife that I still loved her even if she did not believe me.

For many months, I had not seen her smile, but this day, I saw it.  She asked for 
forgiveness which I did wholeheartedly, and that same day, I told her that I am 
now a Christian.

I have never seen my wife this happy before.  She gave her life to Christ too, and 
now we are a happy family, saved from divorce and saved from sin.  I thank God 
for the lessons I have learned from the books.  These books rescued my marriage.”

Many lives are being rescued from darkness and the plans of the evil one through 
the chronological books.

42-June 8, 2023

From Uganda:

“I am [Name withheld].  I was born as a Muslim and married into a Muslim 
family.  Watching my family members grow into hatred and jealousy as a family 
has been one challenging factor.

Many women always admire to be married into Islamic families, hoping there is 
peace, but this is not the genuine truth.  Massive lies which are held here are 
unknown to many people outside of these families.

Being born in Islamic family, I was only allowed a little education, but most of my 
times my mother, being a devoted Muslim, would recite for me the Quran and 
sometimes force me to recite by force . . . with canes [beatings].

I would attend Madrasa or Quranic schools with Arabic teachings.  Although we 
were in these classes with boys, girls were not allowed to mix or intermingle with 
the boys.

Fear befell me as they read in the Quran, Surat [Chapter] 19, as women are not 
allowed to touch the Quran.  We are also not allowed to attend Ijumaa prayers 
when we have our periods, as we are unclean and Allah cannot answer our 
prayers.



In my family, my husband who is a truck driver, would treat me as a useless
woman.  In the Quran, men can marry 4 wives, but even as your right hand
possesess.  So my husband has what is termed as Nikkah kind of marriages.  And
when I spoke, he would threaten me with tawafa (divorce).  This frustrated me so
much.

Then, there came a burden to seek the truth as one day there was a crusade/debate
between Islamic scholars (Sheikh and Imams) and Christians organized by the
church here through chronological booklets.

In sharing, a young man whom I later came to know as Joseph Okello, shared on
God’s love and these are the words he said,  “Whenever [an Israelite] sinned, an
animal must die.”   This sank deep in my heart as I was so much interested in
understanding.  How many times have we slaughtered animals during the holy
month of Ramadhan.  It means that Satan has not been chained as the [Muslim]
scholars would cry out.

Literally, all things that I had believed in were turning into lies to me.  This team
gave me the chronological booklets which I studied diligently at my shop as I
feared my husband would find out.

My behavior started changing by itself.  I saw a greater victory by a seed of
woman.  Loudly, I shouted, for women can be and are a part of these booklets.

When my husband later learned, I told myself not to leave these great teachings.  I
chose to embrace them no matter what challenge.  There is no way.  I can be clean
or I can go back to watery mud.  That is foolishness.  Islam is real scum.

I bought my own Bible which I love dearly, but I only study it with the help of
these booklets.  My husband now has set me free to worship my God and all of my
five children have joined me.

I pray my husband, too, will become a believer in Christ who died for us.  ‘I am
the way, truth and the life.  No one comes to the Father except through me.’

Jesus, thank you for being a way unto me.  Reveal yourself more.  Now that I have
all these booklets, I’ll study more.  I don’t want to be left behind in this great
campaign. Mariam Nawire Christine



43-June 13, 2023

This testimony is from Brother Lawrence in Uganda.  He used to be a truck driver. 

One day, he was highjacked, and shot through the spine, immediately crippling 
him.  Now, every day, he must be dragged outside the home to spend the day 
outside, and then dragged back into the home at night.  Here is his testimony:

“He is the ever faithful God, and He blesses people lives differently.  My family 
was totally paralyzed, and there was no one to speak to my heart a message of 
hope.

Being a Catholic, I only knew that the means to pray to God is to pass through 
Mary,  and that martyrs were praying for us.  This I questioned a lot, yet no truth 
did I find in these.

During the day, many times, my little daughter or my young niece open for me the 
chronological booklets as I read them.  This has been my Bible.  It has been my 
way of life.  I have embraced these teachings, and I have the faith of heaven.

Many times, different people have come to convince me and my family to go to 
the shrine.  Sometimes they have told me that I am cursed.  But my answer has 
been found within the lines of the booklets.

The same way that Satan tempted Jesus, wanting Him to sin, he also tempts us 
daily in order for us to sin.  Thanks be to God for Lessons 49 and 50 which taught 
me a lot concerning this.

I am holding on to my faith,  I am clinging unto my Savior and I believe that He 
can save the whole world,  but only if they believe.

Thanks for the chronological ministry.  How I wish that I could see you in person 
to share my sincere gratitude.  I am humbled that you are allowing Jesus Christ to 
use you to show love to your dear brother.  Blessings and many more blessings.”

Brother Lawrence and family.

44-June 17, 2023

“Dear Brother Ben,



I traveled to Meru On Thursday and I had a wonderful time.  Yesterday I had 
training with pastors from different denominations and tribes.  I introduced the 
lessons by teaching the pastors why we must teaching chronologically and then 
taught lessons 1-10 with them.  After the training we had the time to think way 
forward.

The Chairman  Bishop, Jeremiah Mwangi, had the following to say: ‘We have had 
several teachings, but none have helped us on the way to share the truth with our 
people,  These teachings have opened our eyes on where to begin.   The 
foundation of our faith is God, and if we can understand this way, then our 
congregations will understand too. This is timely when Kenya needs the light. 

The Light is here–the truth of the Gospel.  We need these books urgently, so I 
request that on Sunday we talk to our members, put some money together, and 
order these books immediately.’”

45-June 17, 2023

From Wycliffe:  “At the women’s conference, it was more than what I expected. 

The women were more to it with lots of questions . This is one of the best 
conferences I have taught at.  One of the ladies in the conference had this to say. 

‘This is gold that we hold.  It is a treasure that we have to share with others.  So 
simple that I can even read the book to my children at home.  I don’t need to wait 
till Sunday.  Wish we had these books.  Now I would have gone with my copies 
home.  Christ is coming soon.  We need to start these lessons now.’

46-June 17, 2023

“Another woman from the conference said this:  ‘My husband doesn’t go to 
church and he hasn’t given his life to Christ.  I have wanted to share with him in 
an easy and simple way, but I couldn’t.  Every time I only told him to get saved 
and turn to God without the foundation, but now I believe with these booklets i 
will just read the stories to him and the entire family.  From these my family will 
never be the same.  I need them now.’

As I leave Meru, the pastors have agreed to raise funds to print enough books from 
what they will raise.  I pray that our Lord will use these opportunities to stir the 
hearts of more people to give so that we can help in printing more books for them.

Wycliffe Asigi.



47-June 17, 2023

Daniel Mpekele from Abim, Karamoja, Uganda: “Since I was born, I never wanted 
to listen to anything of Christianity simply because of the Son thing.  I felt this is 
really reducing God to a human being. But after landing in [the New Testament] 
lessons 43 and 44,  my question was sorted.  I felt the Spirit ministering to me and 
immediately I realized I need this Redeemer who died for me.  I believe in Him.”

48-July 2, 2023

Felix Bright writes that the testimony by a Karamajong chief in Uganda gave us a 
humbling moment, and everyone couldn’t stop crying as He kept on testifying:

“Brothers, there is no worse place in terms of cattle rustling than the Karamoja 
region and their brothers, the Turkana of Kenya.  This has brought discrimination 
and many lives have been lost.  My son was a victim and I had nothing else to do.

Personally, I have ordered for the mass killing of the thieves.  Burning the thieves 
hasn’t helped us.  Cutting them into small pieces like firewood hasn’t helped us. 
Imprisoning them is even not a problem to them.

When the government tries more force like offering to pay the people who want to 
be spies of such thieves,, this has even brought more stealing.  Many children and 
family have been burned to warn others, but all this cannot stop them.

Sometime back in December last year, I got a letter requesting for a permission to 
hold a teaching by the name of chronological teaching which looked strange and 
foreign.  At first, I didn’t accept because I thought these are the very people who 
support stealing and even sponsor the thieves with weapons in the name of Bible 
mission work.

To confirm this, I made an agreement and these teachers were placed to sleep near 
a cattle house to ensure that if the cows were taken, they would be held 
responsible.  Throughout their stay, nothing happened, and I said that we need to 
give them more time to know who they are.

Today, I am here to invite you, my sons, not only in the church but even in the 
prisons to share these booklets to the people.  Maybe they’ll change.  I am 
accepting this message and I believe in Him whom you preach.  Your God is



bringing sanity into our land.  Thanks for coming again and thanks more to God
for giving you a bold heart to love the Karamoja region....”

Before He could finish, he broke into a loud cry and uncontrollable one.

48-July 5, 2023

Bithian sent me this testimony from one of the parents:

“I have had a very difficult time with my daughter since when she did her [grade 
school]  exams and graduated to join high school.  She changed completely and 
thought she was now a grown up.

She became rude.  She was never home and when asked she would answer rudely. 
Her father caned her one day and she disappeared from home, only to find her 
married to another old man as a third wife.  We reported the matter to the police 
who helped us get her home.  We took her to school again and we were so afraid 
that she would run away from school. 

 We thank God for what the school has done to our daughter when she came home 
this mid term week.  Ooh, we have seen a new person!

Our girl is back to herself.  She has found a meaning in her life.  She told us that 
she has given her life to Christ after knowing the truth that she was a sinner and 
she needed a Savior!

She showed us copy of some books that she has been reading while in school 
about God and that she discovered that she was in the wrong tribe, the tribe of 
Satan and his demons–the tribe that rude and proud people belong to, and so she 
decided to join God’s tribe, tribe of the humble–the tribe of good people, a tribe 
where children obey their parents, and she is now a child of God.

My daughter knelt down and asked for forgiveness from me and her father.  We 
were amazed and we hugged and cried too–tears of joy–for she was lost and now 
she is back home.

I came to school to see the teacher and share the joy and also thank them for the 
books that my daughter is reading.  They told me a girl called Bithian is the one 
who gave them the books and she is teaching them the Bible stories.  I pray for her



and the one who wrote the book.  Thank you for redeeming my girl.  God bless 
you.”  Mama Immaculate

50-July 5, 2023

Bithian sent me this testimony from one of the teachers:

“God is never late or early.  He is always on time. These lessons came to our 
school at the right time, the time we were struggling to bring the girls back to life.

Wih technology every week,we would suspend a girl from school.  Bad behavior, 
pornography, and sometimes drugs would be found in the dormitory. 
Academically, their school grades were sliding low.

We were so concerned about the girls until God brought Bithian to our school. 
with so simple lessons that we thought were too basic.  She has done magic to our 
girls.  We are at peace now with the students, and we are rising our grades again.

We have received testimonies from parents, too, of the change in their daughters. 
This has pushed me also to study the lessons and, am learning a lot too.  What I 
thought was too basic is the truth from the Bible.

The books are so well arranged that you wish to continue reading the whole book. 
I was among those who believed there was no salvation, but now!  A girl with 
scars on her face has shown me the light, too.

I read the books with my family too as I desire to share the truth with them.  I am 
planning to give my wife a surprise gift of announcing to her that I have given my 
life to Christ too!  It is still a secret.”

Wycliffe finished by saying:

“Reading these testimonies gives me the strength to keep teaching and going 
around Kenya to let the people know the truth.  How many are out their waiting 
for these booklets?  

Oh Lord, provide funds for us to have these golden books reach more.



51-August 12, 2023

From Witchcraft to Christ follower:

I am Sawias Shares.  I am 58 years of age, a widow with 5 children.  I was in a 
family which knew nothing concerning the love of God.

The god whom we worshipped demanded blood sacrifice.  In our clan, the family 
of my father were the custodian of the deity.  We worshipped them and even 
offered sacrifices to them.

I remember I was initiated into witch craft one year before my father’s demise as I 
was the only child.  I automatically became the heir.

I got married, made a home for the deity, and I would offer food to them though 
they didn’t eat.  Being a witch doctor was my pride.

One day, before my husband went to war in the Nuba mountains, I made for him a 
special charm.  When he died there, I started doubting the powers of our deities. 
The more I tried, the more I faced challenges.

One morning, a sheik came to me.  He did his incantation to scare away the evil. 
This, too, did not work.

Last year, my young sons came with a teaching and as I was on the run for my life, 
I decided to only listen.  These booklets captivated me and I carried some back to 
the Nuba mountains for my family.  We had the peace of God in us as we read the 
booklets, even though they needed to be interpreted, as I don’t have any English.

When the second teaching came to me in Juba, I realized that these teachings were 
very true.   I love them.  On Sunday, I was part of those who were baptized in 
water as a sign of repentance.  I pray that my family too would be baptized just as I 
was.

I have found a peace that I cannot describe.  I have no more fear of serving the 
gods of the land.  Earlier this year, I burned the house in which I had sacrificed to 
the demons.

Thanks for sharing these booklets, we want to learn more from them.



52-August 16, 2023

I am Makua Batil Tumana of the Koalib tribe of the Nubians.  For all of my life, 
all that I have known has been witchcraft although I am a Muslim by religion.

Being a witch doctor has caused me to commit a lot of sins like killing, damaging 
families, intimidation, and much more.  I remember that women would come to 
me, and I would lie to them and even rape them in order to satisfy myself.

On Saturday, I was up on the mountain needing to make a choice as I had been 
hearing strange voices telling me to repent.  I heard people praying, and for the 
first time, the whole mountain was covered by light.  I heard a voice speaking to 
me to repent.

I am so feared that when people see me they would run away, thinking I would kill 
them instantly.  I didn’t know that it was the devil using me.

Before I knew it, I was powerless and paralyzed on the ground while people were 
praying.  While I was on the ground, I had a picture in a dream of a man telling me 
to repent and be baptized.  I knew this was to be a very hard task and I wasn’t 
ready for it.

On Sunday, I started walking, asking about the people who were praying on the 
mountain.  When I reached them, everyone started to run away, but I told them not 
to run because I wanted to talk to them about something very important 
concerning my life.

The people were talking about baptism--the very word that I had heard in the 
dream.  They also said that if I would repent, Jesus Christ will forgive me of my 
witchcraft, rape, and killing, among many other sins.

At this point, I broke into tears because of what I had done.  “You mean Jesus can 
forgive me of all of this?  You mean Jesus can forgive me for being a witch?  You 
mean Jesus can forgive me for killing his people?  You mean Jesus can forgive me 
of all of my sins?”

When I was reassured of this, I told everyone that nothing could stop me from 
believing in Jesus and being baptized.



A few people said that I could not be baptized because I did not have clothes to 
change, but I told them,  “If I have been rained on at the top of this mountain for 
more than five hours while serving demons and idols, a short time is nothing.  I am 
ready and nothing will stop me, for I want to repent and be forgiven of my sins.  I 
receive Jesus as my Lord and Savior.”  At this point, everyone broke into tears.

The rest is from Felix, the evangelist working in South Sudan:  “We used a donkey 
to carry water which we poured into a hole that we had dug specifically for 
baptism.  Having confessed Jesus, Brother Makua was then baptized.

“Praise the Lord that you have been part of the team not only in sending 
financially to print these booklets, but also in prayer just like Hannah in the Bible. 

Thank you so much for being part of what God is doing.  Keep praying for 
boldness and peace in our hearts as we share the gospel with the unreached.  We 
love you so much and we remain humbled to minister together with the 
chronological biblical study.”

53-August 25, 2023

Pastor James Mutembei wrote from Maua Meru:

“Teaching chronological stories is like opening the Bible afresh.  Ever since we 
began to teach the lessons, God has done a lot to us and more people are coming in 
for the lessons.  We foresee a total transformation among our members.  So far we 
have just done the first ten lessons and there is a lot to be desired.  The love of 
God to mankind even in our sinful nature still gives us hope.  The clear stand of 
God and the purpose of His creation reveals His power.  These lessons are timely 
and straight to the point.  Easy to understand for everyone no matter their level. 
These are the gold and life we need.”

It’s because of this that the church has raised money to pay for more 200 copies 
for those who didn’t get a copy.

54-August 28, 2023

From South Sudan:  Testimony of rain.

It was on Frida, early in the morning, and people’s crops are dying due to much 
sunshine, while gathered together in the morning devotion, we prayed the Lord to



bring rain.  No signs of rain, but we kept believing in God.  Maybe He would do 
something that He alone could do.

My friend Yaba asked me, “You mean God won’t bring rain today?”  I had to let 
him know that God can do anything, and it’s in His power.

Thirty minutes later, there was a heavy storm that broke houses, and nearby trees 
fell on rooftops.  Yaba found that as an opportunity to remind us of the sins of the 
people which has brought manycalamities.  We both asked for God’s forgiveness 
and commanded the storm to cease.  After few minutes, it was calm and rain 
started pouring.  I saw a happy Yaba dance and praise the Lord.

In the morning we asked for the rain and in the evening God brought the rain and 
also calmed the stormy wind.  Thanks for keeping us in prayers.  Romans 8:37

55-August 28, 2023

Praise the Lord.  On Saturday, we moved into the forest to share the word of God 
with a team of youth and elderly people who needed this word so much.  There 
was fear among them from the religious leaders and also sheiks and imams.

The journey was an interesting journey.  We had to get a motorcycle and had to 
ride for 2 and half hours.  It was a journey full of new challenges and total trust in 
God.

When we reached the forest, we found some had already arrived there, and they 
were slashing the grass and preparing the place where we were to sit and listen to 
the word of God.  To me, I saw  passionate people who are in need of a Saviur and 
nothing would stop them from finding one if there was a chance.

Please keep on praying for these new believers for the Lord to strengthen them and 
that they would become an army to spread the word of God.

Many folks came to the Lord and they said that they believe in this teaching.  “It is 
true! It is true!”

They said this, “Pray that our leaders would understand this and walk in it, that 
they would come to the Lord understanding  the importance of knowing the true 
word of God whose foundation is Jesus Christ.”



Romans 1:16.   Blessings and many more blessings.

56-September 14, 2023

From a Maasai elder:

“Listening to God is one of the things I have learnt from these books.  God wants 
us to listen to Him.  I now know that God speaks to us and we must listen to him.

I have been a big headed man.  I did what I wanted and no one could stop me.  I 
remember fighting in the market and being arrested and spending weeks in the 
cells just for not listening to my wife who had told me to stop.  I chose my ways 
just like Lot who didn’t listen to God and ended up in a bad place full of evil.

I want to obey and listen to God just like Abraham.  The books are teaching me 
how to obey God.  God created us.  Cows can not save us.  Only God can.  All my 
animals died when we had the drought.  They left me, but God has not left me,  He 
still teaches me.”

57-September 21, 2023
.

“I am Hussein, a Form Three student at Renewal school in Yida.  On Monday 
when I heard the news about the teachings to be taught in our school through 
the chronological booklets, I was eager to learn.

The only challenge is I am a Muslim, and in our family, while growing up, my 
family taught me one important lesson–life is war and we have to fight physically. 
If one is a Christian, he must be killed or be fought until he believes in Allah
(Jihad).

If a woman disrespected the husband, she must either be divorced, beaten or be 
denied conjugal rights. This I personally saw my brother doing, and that has been 
making me so worried, beating my own wife.

In these lessons I am learning about the love for the enemy.  We are God’s enemy, 
but He first he loved us.  Because of Adam, the ground was cursed, and an animal 
was slaughtered [so that Adam could be clothed].  This really is not true in Islam 
which allows the death of infidels and non-believers.  I am learning a lot, but yet I 
want to know the truth and follow it when I am ready.”



Felix writes: “Please pray for Hussein, that the Lord would touch him more and
bring him to Christ.  Amen.”

58-September 23, 2023

From Felix:

“Yesterday while we were continuing to share, Hussein came in front and boldly 
believed the Lordship of the Lord Jesus Christ.

He said that Jesus has been speaking with Him through dreams, but that He has 
never ever understood the real meaning.  As we were sharing, he said this: 

‘I remembered what war has done to our land, that our people are dying of hunger, 
that they are so thirsty yet no water to drink, and that they are killing each other.

There is no greater joy than to find there is a man who died for me.  He died so 
that I can live–just as an animal died so that Adam and Eve could live.  As for my 
prophet [Mohamed], he died and has never came back to life.  I have no hope in 
Him.  I want to follow my Savior.  It is only Jesus who can save me–no one else.’

In yesterday’s gathering, many folks accepted the lordship of Christ over their 
lives at Renewal high school.  We are going to have time for discipleship every 
Sunday with them, just as we were having it in Juba.”

59-September 25, 2023

Gisma Tutu is a student of Renewal high school.  Here is her testimony:

“I was born in the Nuba mountains of Sudan.  I came to the Yida refugee camp in 
2015 at the peak of war which was so severe in the Nuba mountains.  I lost my 
mother in the war which has so challenged me in the brain and this has led to 
many more challenges.

I have always wanted revenge for what happened to me, wanting to kill, and this 
has almost called me into witch craft.  I did not know that one day I would have 
someone who would share with me a lovely message from a lovely book about a 
lovely God.



My heart is full of tears of sorrow by seeing my mother dead, by seeing my 
brothers have become war addicts, and by smoking (not clear here).

Today, I have chosen to change my ways.  I want to walk with Jesus.  I am 
beginning a new journey with my Lord and Savior Jesus Christ.

Please pray with me.  I am among the students who brought charms to be burnt.  I 
feel a peace that I have never felt before.  I am feeling fresh inside and the 
rottenness has gone.

I am happy to be called a child of God, and I am praying that the Lord will help 
me to forgive all those who hurt me so much by taking my price, my beloved 
mother in my presence.”  Gisma Tutu.

60-September 26, 2023

Nayere from Burundi said, “Many times I have tried to understand sin because I 
am told not to sin.  So what is sin and where did it start?   This have been my 
question and now I know.  Sin is living against the standards of God.  No wonder 
we are all sinners.  These books have made it clear to me that from creation, God 
wants us to worship him and to do His will.  Only God is good and all people are 
bad.  The chronological booklets have this all.”

61-September 26, 2023

Pastor Nduwamungu from Burundi is happy that he is learning both the word of 
God and Swahili too.  “I have the full joy of my life now that am learning God’s 
Word as I learn how to read Swahili too.  This has made it easy for my evangelism 
class.  My class had only 12 students but now I have 50.  As many come, I believe 
they will hear the truth from the books too.  I hope our Bishop will send us more 
books soon.”

62-September 26, 2023

From Pastor Emabale in Rwanda:  “I wish we had these books before [the 
genocide] happened.  I am sure there would have been no tribal wars.  People 
perished because they lacked knowledge. The knowledge has come to us now. 

The truth is in these books.  When we know God, we know the truth.  God has 
revealed himself in His Word , and it is true–the Word is God himself.  These



lessons help us discover this truth.  Genocide happened because there was no 
truth.  People were in darkness.”

63-October 6, 2023

From the president of the ADC, one of the largest denominations in eastern Africa:

“God is always doing a new thing with an aim of making us His friends always. 

Teaching the chronological lessons has made me know more about the Lord I 
serve.  I have had more joy just by teaching simple truths with simple booklets. 

Giving these booklets to someone makes me feel like giving birth to a new person 
or giving new life to a dead body.  It reminds me of what Ezekiel felt with the dry 
bones.”

He continued,  “I thank God for the chronological ministry, for the support, and 
for putting together these books that are more valuable than gold.  These books are 
life just like the Word of God is life to us.  I want these books to be all over 
Burundi and Rwanda.  People need the truth and we must give it to them.  We 
cannot be there every day, but the books will be there.  They can read them any 
time.   We must take the books there now!”

64-October 11, 2023

“My name is Vestinah Vazamungabo.  I am alone in the world as I lost all of my 
family in the genocide.  For years I have struggled, asking myself why God spared 
my life.  I remember very well that the night before it happened, our parents 
gathered all of us together and asked us to give our lives to Jesus as this would be 
the only way we would have peace in our lives.  That same night, the killings 
began in the neighboring village.  

I never knew if my parents knew what was going to happen as our village was 
attacked the next day.  Everyone in my family who was home was killed.  The 
only reason I survived is because I was in school.  I ran off from school with my 
friends.  We spent days and days running and running, not even knowing where 
we were running to, until we found ourselves in Burundi where we were taken to a 
refugee camp.

Living in the refugee camp, the words of my parents have never left me.  For all 
this time, I have been struggling to understand, “Who is this Jesus whom my father



spoke of”?

A year ago, my friend invited me to attend a training in Kenya.  I accepted because
the church was paying for us.  In Kenya, I was only excited because this was my
first time to get out of the refugee camp.  What I didn’t know was that this trip
would be the answer to all of my prayers.

In the training, we were taught of God’s grace upon us sinners and His love for us. 
The people who love Him are of His tribe and those who hate him are of Satan’s
tribe.  I thought of the people who killed my family and wondered where they
would belong.

What has filled me with joy is that I have discovered who this Jesus is!  He is the
one who died for me so that I may live.  When people disobeyed God, Jesus took
the blame.  This I discovered from a set of books that I received in our training,
that is, the chronological lessons.  I now have a treasure for I now have my very
own booklets.

I now know Abrahan, Lot, Moses, and many others for I was taught about them.  I
now love Jesus because He is my life.  He is also my strength and the way to my
eternal joy.

I want to live a life that fits in the standard of God.  I want to teach my people
these lessons.  I know that there are more like me who are seeking for the truth.  I
want to give them these books because they are self taught.  No need to follow
false prophets.

Whenever I feel stressed, I read the books and feel happy.  These books have
changed me and my views about life.

I have forgiven those who killed my family.  I believe that I will one day meet
Jesus and tell him how He has made me happy.

I am praying for whoever wrote these booklets that God will give them more light
about His word and then write more books.”

From Wycliffe,  “Lord Jesus, help us to meet the desires of Vestinah and others
who need to know you more.”



65-November 2, 2023

“I thank God for these teachings.  They have taught me how to forgive.

I got married to a lovely woman whom I didn’t know she was married before.  We 
lived together for one year without my knowledge of her previous marriage.  She 
got pregnant with our first born child and hell broke loose for me.

One day, I came home and found three men standing in my compound.  I greeted 
them and asked them why they were here.  They told me that they had just 
escorted their brother here, that he is inside, and that I can go talk to him.

I hurried into the house, only to find my wife in a corner and a body of a man lying 
dead in my living room with blood all over the floor.  I asked my wife what 
happened, and she said that the man had come to take her back as he was her 
husband.

When she refused, the man grabbed her hand, but she pushed him, and he fell on 
the table that broke and a piece of wood pierced his head.  This shocked me, but 
because of the love I had for her and the unborn child, I took the responsibility 
when the police came.

I was jailed for ten years for murder.  After the ten years, I came home only to find 
my wife had married another man for she couldn’t wait for me.  This made me 
mad, for I was jailed for something I didn’t do, carrying someone else’s sin, and 
yet, she still got married and left me.

My anger grew every day.  I thought about it daily until I came to the church and 
listened to some stories that our pastor was sharing with us.  The Israelites kept 
disobeying God, yet God loved them.  God sent his Son to take our sins, but we 
are the ones who should have been crucified.  He did it for us, yet on the cross, 
Jesus still prayed for them even while He was still hanging on the cross.

This struck me and I felt that I needed to be like Jesus.  Yes, I was jailed for love 
just like Jesus who died on the cross because he loved us.  I gave my life to Jesus 
and asked Him to teach me how to forgive.  Indeed he taught me how.

I visited my child where they lived and forgave my wife and got reunited with my 
loving daughter.  The pain went away.  The hatred I had for women went away. 



Jesus gave me another wife, and now, I am living happily with my daughter and 
her new mother.

This happened because of the teachings the pastor taught us from the 68 books he 
came with.  I am waiting to get my copy so I can share with the others who are still 
in pain like I was.  I call them the forgiveness manuals!  I am Vincent.”

66-November 2, 2023

“As a Rwandan, it is very easy for me to relate with the two tribes, that is, the tribe 
of God and the tribe of Satan.  In Rwanda, we have the Tutsis and Hutus who have 
all lived together like brothers.

I loved the story of Joseph.  They all lived together as brothers until when Satan 
took over Joseph’s brothers and they decided to kill their own.  The same 
happened in Rwanda.  Satan took over, brothers hated each other, and brothers 
killed each other.

I have had the same hatred too.  I hated the Hutus so much because I believe they 
killed my two brothers.  From the chronological booklets, Cain killed his brother 
Abel because of Satan who wanted more people to disobey God.  I was heading to 
that point of disobeying God.

I used to attend church, but I didn’t have a personal relationship with God.  Just 
like Cain, I would give my offerings with hate in my heart.  After this training, I 
now know where my hate is coming from.  I now know it is Satan who wants to 
take me away from God.  I won’t allow him.

I have been planning to take revenge for my brothers’ death, but now I believe 
God loves me.  This is why he sent you.  God saw what Cain did.  God saw what 
Joseph’s brothers did.  I believe he also saw what happened in Rwanda.  I am here 
to give my hate to Jesus and renounce my pains.  I want to remain in the tribe of 
God and be a son of God, not Satan.”  Haberimana Salim

(Christians prayed for him after having given his testimony)

67-November 7, 2023

Ahmdan Ibrahims from the Dalokal tribe in Nuba Mountains, South Sudan.



“Sometimes, being a father, we learn many things through mistakes.

I was once married and with my wife, we had three kids.  I later traveled to 
Khartoum and when I came back to Nuba mountain, I started abusing my wife.

Being a Muslim, it is not a crime to beat your wife until they obey, and I would 
gladly use that scripture to beat my wife vigorously.  Today, I regret over the 
things that I did.  My wife separated from me before the war began in the Nuba 
Mountains, and took our kids away with her since I was so much of a drunk.  I 
could not take care of the children nor even myself.

I started living a reckless life of drinking, using witchcraft, fighting, and all of this 
would break me when I didn’t even know that they’re breaking me.

When the war began, I came in to South Sudan as a refugee, and this is where I 
started realizing the importance of freedom.  I fell sick in the Yida refugee camp, 
and more sickness came as the days passed by  Going to the hospital, I was told 
that I had a problem in my chest.  Weeks later, I developed a problem with 
breathing and later on in my bones.

I was so low that I went into witchcraft.  I cut myself and placed charms on the 
wounds.  I also had a charm around my waist from one of the Muslim sheiks, but 
none of these helped me.

I thank Jesus today for I have found God who healed me.  I no longer feel pain in 
my chest, and my breathing has improved since I said “Yes” to Jesus Christ.  My 
bones also are no longer weak, for I am growing strong again.

Today, I am a believer in Jesus Christ.  I am happy that I was baptized, and every 
Sunday, I attend for more teaching.  My appetite for alcohol is gone.  I am no 
longer going to the mosque or even witchcraft.  I threw the charms away.

I had found total freedom in Jesus Christ.  I want to be a written testimony, a book 
that every Muslim will know about.

Hallelujah.  I pray that God will bring me more joy, that I would meet my kids, 
and ask for forgiveness for having been a bad father.  Amen.

68-November 8, 2023



Testimony from the printer in Nairobi, Kenya:

“We have been in the business of printing for several years now and you are one 
of our valued customers.  Not because of the money you pay but the effect of what 
we are printing.  Ever since you gave us permission to use the books in our 
morning devotions, I have seen a great spiritual growth with my staff.  There is 
more harmony and friendship among the staff.

Kimanzi was alcoholic.  He would come drunk on duty, but he has changed a lot. 

Not just him but more of the staff have changed.  I believe some have given their 
lives to Christ, but haven't announced it yet.  We no longer push them to work. 
They all work with minimal supervision and the production has also increased. 

We read a lesson each day and then pray together.  I have assigned each one a 
lesson to read, and all must attend the prayer time.

This books are magical, simple and to the point.  It goes straight to what we need 
to know. Am reading the lessons to my kids too, now that the schools are closed 
and they are home.

Once again, thank you for trusting us to serve you and also sharing this wisdom 
with us.”

When we asked about the price he is charging us to print, this is what he said:

“We will keep the same price we charge even if the price of paper and ink has 
gone up.  Currently we are meeting the exact printing cost and we are happy to 
continue because we have more customers who have come in and we can get more 
profit from them as we take part in this noble cause of sharing the Good news. 
God bless you.”

Hannington Maheli.

69-November 8, 2023

“I am Sarah from the Shatt tribe in the Nuba Mountains.

Fighting is one of the activities that we, as a community, love.  Growing up, I 
would see people fighting not just for land or food or wives, but we literally 
fought for everything.



Being married, I developed the culture of fighting even in the family.  I would 
fight my husband so badly that he feared me.  We are reknown women of war, and 
this brought me to the state I am today.  My husband couldn’t put up with me 
anymore and we separated.

When war broke out, I came from Kaduguli to Yida, South Sudan, as a refugee, 
and started a life of staying with my kids, Iklas, Ikram, and Thu.  Alone, I have 
been raising them up, but believing in war and fighting.  Anything that I wanted, I 
would fight for it forcefully whether with a knife or any other means as long as it 
would be mine.

Through the teachings I have been receiving, I said that I want this Jesus because I 
understood how war has broke up my family.  Now that I am a believer of Jesus 
Christ, I no longer have the appetite of war.  Fighting with people is no longer a 
part of me.  I am no longer interested in fighting and am glad I am a changed 
person.”

70-November 8, 2023

“Baptism doesn’t save us.  It is, however, a symbol that we are dying and are 
ressurecting with Jesus.  It is an act of obedience to Jesus Christ through Great 
commission.  In the Yida Refugee camp, this is one of the four ordinances 
misinterpreted and neglected by the religious leaders putting aside prayer, the 
Holy Spirit, and Holy Communion.

The evangelical church in Block Eleven which is the Daloka people group knew 
little of the Lord Jesus Christ.  We have been sharing these teachings, and we 
thank God that He is teaching His truth through us, and that we are not speaking in 
our own flesh.

The last week of October on a Sunday, we were able to baptize many people. 

After the baptism, many people shared a testimony of what the Lord Jesus Christ 
has done in their lives

Yaba said,  “I had placed somebody in my heart and made a vow to never forgive 
him after what he did to me.  Now I feel myself so light.  I am seeing no more need 
to hurt him.  I want to meet him and tell him that I have forgiven him.”

Gismo Tutu says, “For a long time, I always thought that baptism was not a



necessary thing.  Others have scared us, telling us that if we are baptized, we shall 
go back to our old life of evil.  Today, I am saying that now that I am baptized, my 
bad dreams are gone, and I am able to sleep as well as a little child.”

“When we see the Gospel as a Good News from God and not a white man’s 
message, this becomes the beginning of every means to reach out to God.  I 
thought that this was a white man’s message to confuse black people, but now I 
know that it a message from God.”  From TR at Napoleon Renewal High School.

71-November 8, 2023

Before conversion, Yusuf was a Muslim man as well as both of his parents.  One 
day, the Lord visited the grandfather of Yusuf (who was an Imam), and his life 
never remained the same.

The Muslim leaders in Khartoum tried to convince Yusuf’s grandfather (his name 
was Yunus) to recount, and when he refused, they burned him at the stake.  Before 
Yunus was burned to death, he removed his bangle and gave it as a blessing to 
Yusuf telling him to always remember that he is an icon or reflector of peace in 
their tribe.

Upon the death of Yunus, Yusuf was heartbroken and decided to learn the truth. 

One day, he said “yes” to the Lord.  In spite of the many challenges of witchcraft, 
sorcery, murder, rape, and abduction, Yusuf has remained steadfast in His duty of 
praying for His people.

Yusuf said this: “I am so proud that Jesus died for my sin, removed me from 
religious duties, and accepted me as His own.  I am looking forward to seeing a 
new home, a hope, and a blessed community only in the line of the Lord. 
Especially now that you have shared with us the chronological booklets, they are a 
true reflection of my Kacha tribe from which I come.  Keep praying with me and 
sharing the booklets until all men know the truth.”

Just like Yusuf, let us take the burden of reaching and praying for communities in 
the Nuba mountains.  Lord, we pray that many will know you through the 
testimony of Yusuf in Jesus’ mighty name.  Amen.

72-November 8, 2023



Abdu Salim, from Renewal High School, is one of the many converts who has 
believed in the Lord Jesus Christ, a humbled man who wants to know the Lord.

Since knowing the truth about the Lord Jesus Christ, he has never left the 
teachings of the Lord Jesus, indicating a humbled heart who is ready to learn 
and to teach others.

Brother Abdu wasn’t only ready to learn but also to obey whatever the Lord Jesus 
Christ wants to be done or simply believe in Him.

On Sunday, as others were being baptised in the pool, brother Abdu was very 
eager to see that his past would be buried and never come back.  He said yes to 
water baptism and with gladness, he received a free gift from the Lord of salvation 
who has died for him.

Pray that Brother Abdu will grow boldness to share His faith in the Lord Jesus 
Christ.  True witnesses are not ashamed and that’s what we’re praying for as a 
team.  Amen.

73-November 8, 2023

Testimony of Thuku Tia from the Shatt tribe who has been forced to live a life of 
bitterness and unforgiveness due to what happened to him.  He is a 7th Class pupil 
at Omolo Primary School in Yida, and has faced different challenges.  This was 
due to the civil war in the Nuba mountains.

“I can’t remember everything as I was young, but one day while we were in the 
Nuba mountains in our school, war broke out.  I saw a plane flying from a far 
distance, and a voice spoke to me, that I was to run into a fox hole (there are 
hideouts which are dug all over the Nuba mountain so that when war erupts, one 
can find safety).

Before I could enter inside (I really don’t understand what took place), I felt a 
sharp pain in my right hand and coldness.  Finding my self inside a fox hole, I was 
bleeding profusely.  I tried to stop the blood, but fainted.  What I can remember 
after many days were wounds and half an arm missing from my body.

Learning to work with one hand with another lame has not been an easy task for 
me for I was not born like that.  When I understood that it was a civil war



involving Arabs, I have had a deep hatred for Arabs while fearing planes.

My hand got healed and I had to learn to work without an arm, but one thing 
surely never got healed–my heart–a scar that could take seasons and seasons to 
heal.  I dropped out of school and when I came to the refugee camp, there was one 
thing in me–revenge.

After a series of sharing these booklets, I have understood what it means to forgive 
my enemies. I want to go to heaven even if I am missing one hand.  I have 
forgiven my enemies and I am walking a new journey.

Thanks to Bright Felix for being a tool to share these teachings.”

74-November 17, 2023

This is from Felix working in South Sudan.  A testimony from a former Muslim:

“In my life,” says [name withheld], “I have never received this kind of a message 
of a loving God, in a loving manner, in a loving way.

I have always wanted to know God more.  Being a Muslim is like being chained, 
and we need the truth to be taught, learnt, and to be made known to the Muslim 
world.

Today, it is a great privilege to hear of the Good News about God and His Son, 
although I didn’t believe this at first, being taught differently by the sheiks

(Muslim teachers).  I have lived in lies and hated the truth.  I have fought and 
rejected the truth.

But when this Son of God appeared to me in a dream with bleeding hands, asking 
me why am I beating myself on the rock and denying Him, I wept and I said that I 
needed to be forgiven.  What’s more amazing is that this very dream appeared to 
my wife and to one of my sons.

We needed this message and we have taken it in.  We are Christians from now on. 

Only please do not expose us because we are with Muslims all the time.  Please 
don’t take any of our photos but let someone come to share with us the Good 
Message to help us to grow and to soon be ready to face the world.”



Not to be openly shared:  Abdul Karims and his family live near the mosque.  He 
has a wife, two brothers, and four children.

75-December 1, 2023

Sister Amira has been a great tool being used by the Lord to preach to different 
souls, and through her, her entire household who were previously non-believers 
are now believing.

Her husband said this:  “I have learnt from my wife through the stories in the 
booklets of the importance of believing in God.  I am no longer a Muslim.  My 
God doesn’t want me to kill for him.  He died for me and I want this good God.” 
Sadik, Amira’s husband.

76-December 1, 2023

Brother Khakis Tutu shares with us how the devil damaged his life, but thanks to 
God who has brought salvation, and made it possible.

“Having done all things in the religion of Islam, nothing could save me.  I was so 
addicted to sin that one day I ran naked from my farm.  Everybody who looked at 
me laughed. Slowly but surely I was running mad.

When my sisters shared with me the booklets, all that I could say was that one day 
God could bring it to pass.  I am here because God has saved me from the power 
of sin, Satan, and death.  Thanks for sharing Jesus with us.”

77-December 13, 2023

From PAG Name Withheld (Kenya?):

“God blessed me with only one child, a girl who I loved so much.  My husband 
and I did all we could to see her through the school until she got married and had a 
nice paying job with the government.  To this day, I remember how we struggled 
with schooling her and now she is gone.  We cannot enjoy the fruits of our labor, 
and I got envious.  The devil filled me with hatred for her husband as I thought he 
was the one who took her from us.  I wanted my daughter back–not because of my 
love for her, but for her wealth.



Because of this, I went to a witch doctor who gave me a charm to kill her husband. 

I was to put it in his food which I did.  Unfortunately her husband came late and 
my daughter ate the food and died.  I killed my daughter!

I have lived in this pain for years until I got these booklets that transformed me.  I 
haven’t confessed this to anyone, but I am telling you as I ask God for forgiveness. 

From the books I have learned that there are only two tribes–the bad and the good, 
the people of God and the people of Satan.  I have to choose where to belong.  I 
don't want to go to hell.

Just as God forgave the Israelites, I begged Him to forgive me too.  I trust in the 
Savior whom God sent to save us from sin.  I confessed to Him my sins and am 
asking for courage on how to face my husband.  These books have taught me the 
freedom we have in Christ.  These books have taught me the true love of God. 

These books have taught me forgiveness.  I am free because I have given my life 
to Jesus.  I thank God for sending these books to me.”

78-December 15, 2023

From Bithian in Kapsobet, Kenya:

My name is Francis Livuga, a teacher at St Mary's Yala girls.  I am a proud teacher 
today because of the chronological lessons.   At first, I despised the lessons, 
thinking they were too basic, but now I confess there is no basic in the word of 
God.  Every word of God is true and it is God Himself.

Bithian began to teach in our school late last year.  Our school was rated among 
the undisciplined schools in the county.  Every term we lost students who 
transferred to other schools.  The opposite has happened.  We now have lots of 
applications to join our school as there is a great change with the students.

Bithian has helped bring sanity back through the lessons.  Last term, a group of 
girls brought to the office all their sex toys that they had brought to school without 
our knowledge.  Seeing these girls kneeling and begging for forgiveness from the 
teachers opened my eyes too.  I also cried because we had never seen such things 
before and we never knew what our girls were doing.

We all held our hands together and prayed as Bithian led the girls to Christ.  As a 
teacher, I did the same.  I gave my life to Christ the same day too.  The atmosphere



at the school is now family life.  During our parents-teachers meeting, all the 
parents testified of the changes in their girls and thanked the Lord for the new 
program that we began in school.  We are so proud of Bithian and we thank God 
for using the lessons to help our girls and me to see the light.

79-December 15, 2023

I am Beatrice, a student in Kapsobet, and my life was hell.  When I joined the 
school in Form One, I joined a group of girls who I thought were good girls.  They 
always had money, and could buy anything they wanted.  They promised to teach 
me the business that they do so that I could earn my own money.

When the schools closed for the holiday, we met and they took me to a hotel 
where they forced me to have sex with a man old enough to be my father.  He gave 
me money after which I was happy, but hurt in my heart.  We did this the whole 
holiday and when we came back to school, I had money too.

We sneaked out of school several times to record ponographic videos and we 
bought sex toys that we used to record videos.  I am so ashamed of what we did. 

The worst thing is that I got pregnant and I had to abort the baby.  This damaged 
my uterus and I will never have a child.

I am so ashamed of myself, but have hope after the lessons that I have been 
learning through the booklets.  I belonged to the wrong tribe of murderers.  I 
belonged to the devil's tribe, but now I gave my life to Christ after learning that He 
is the only one who can save me.

I thank God for sending us a Savior who can carry all of our filth and give us 
hope.  I have surrendered all to Christ and I believe in Him to forgive and to save 
me.  The lessons are so simple and easy to understand.  I am now a proud daughter 
of God. 

80-December 15, 2023

From the General Secretary of the PAG in Kenya regarding the Acts lessons:

“These are wonderful lessons about The Holy Spirit!  Very useful for the church to 
know God, the Holy Spirit, and the early church.  We are ready to roll it out in our 
churches.”



81-December 17, 2023

It is a beautiful thing to see our great God doing great things, seeing His presence 
in our lives.  In the Yida Refugee camp it has been a place of sharing the love of 
God, and with one heart, we have got deeper into sharing his Word in the camp. 

The fruit has always been our prayer, that is that the Lord Jesus wouild enable us 
to bear much fruit even up to one hundred fold.

Last week, we finished the open sharing through open air crusade and camp 
evangelism to reach different people within the camp.  Our focus was mainly the 
students who had arrived from Nuba mountains for taking their exams.

Our great passion is sharing and loving more His Word through the chronological 
Bible booklets.

Sharing one microphone was such an amazing moment, and there is no greater joy 
than seeing many crying out unto the Lord as He alone can save us.

Pastor William had to share this testimony with us:

“Being in the Catholic Church, I had learnt of different ways to reach out to God. 

One of the ways I learnt is through Mary whom everyone knew and knows in 
Catholic to be the mother of God.

When I read the first lessons, I got an answer that no one gave birth to God, no one 
created God.  In the past, we have been praying this way, ‘Mary mother of God, 
pray for us sinners.’  Therefore, looking for our own way to God and not God’s 
way to Him.”

“Religion,” continues pastor William, “has blinded us so much that we can no 
longer see anything, but through the chronological booklets, I am learning that 
God’s way to God is the only way to God–no other way.”

Let us pray that Pastor William will turn the face of Nuba mountains and the Muru 
tribe as he goes back with the students to the Nuba mountain.  Through these 
testimonies, many people believed in the Lord.  Amen.

From Felix Bright



82-December 23, 2023

Wycliffe’s Radio Program:

“My name is Geoffrey Luvaha and I am a proud listener of Vuuka Fm Radio.  I do 
not go to church because the pastors only preach about money and their own 
personal issues.  I have had a very difficult time understanding the Bible and our 
relationship with God.  I moved from church to church in search of the truth, but I 
was continually disappointed.

I thank God for the radio program, ‘What the Bible says’ (the name of the 
program).  I have learnt a lot from the program, starting from creation, how sin 
came, and the love of God for me. Yes, I agree that there are only two things in all. 
Male and female, good and evil, light and darkness, joy and sadness.  Each one of 
us has to choose.  Darkness belongs to Satan and light is from the Lord.

This has made me happy as I now understand.  Listening to the radio has brought 
meaning to my life.  I gave my life to Christ when Reverend Asigi asked people to 
accept the Savior.  I accepted and gave my life to Christ.  I believe one day I will 
meet with you face to face so I can just give you a thank you hug.  Keep teaching 
as I still want to learn more.  Pray for me too that I will obey my Savior.  I now 
belong to the good tribe.  Hallelujah!”

83-December 23, 2023

From Pastor Moffat:

“We have had a lot of rain in eastern Kenya.  Since I could not get back home 
because of the rains, I decided to visit a village where I have taught before.

I entered the village and I was met by a Muslim guy who was so happy to meet 
me.  I couldn’t remember him, but he greeted me with joy and invited me to his 
house.  When I was in his home, I listened to him as he told me what had 
happened.  Here is his story:”

“I was a Muslim, and I have been practicing sorcery.  I was lying to people that I 
could heal their sicknesses and anything else.  All I needed was their money.

One day, I came home and my wife gave me a booklet to read in Borana, for she is



a Borana.  I hated Christians as this is what I was taught at the Madrassa (Muslim
school).  I asked her what the book was about, but she told me to just read it.

I have read all the lessons.  The last time Pastor Moffatt was teaching here, I came
to the church, but nobody recognized me.  I wanted to know who gave the books
to my wife. The books have spoken to me.

When the rains came, I gave God a test.  All the years that it has been raining, we
had to move to other places. This time, I asked the God of these booklets to prove
to me that He is my Savior and to save us from moving.  I promised Him that if He
would save me, I would give my life to Him.

As I told the pastor, we are still here.  Yes, some houses have been swept away by
the floods, but mine still stands.  This is proof that the Savior lives.  So, I was
waiting for the pastor to lead me to Him.  I asked God to send the pastor to me,
and now the pastor is here.

I called together my wife and my children.  I said, ‘Please, from today, my family
and I, we surrender to the Savior.’”

Pastor Moffatt concludes by saying this:  “I prayed for them with tears of joy in
my eyes.  Indeed, our Lord is ALIVE!  The entire family of seven children,
husband, and wife are now in the Lord’s family.  Glory to God!”

From Wycliffe:

THE RADIO PROGRAM.   God has given us an opportunity to teach
chronological lessons through the radio every Sunday from 8:00 am to 9:00 am
with over a million listeners.  This is the first program to be aired in a Kenyan
radio.  We are humbled with messages that encourage us to keep teaching, as lives
are being transformed through the truths we share.

MAASAI:  The Maa community, as they are often referred to, are in Kenya and
Tanzania.  We have printed and translated thirty lessons (1-30), and the booklets
are already in the bush with the people.  We are continuing with the translation of
lessons 31-42 into Maasai.  After sharing the lessons in a church, one of the
village chiefs has requested that the lessons be shared during his weekly
government meeting with the village.  This will be done in the open field at the



village square where everybody must attend.  We are trusting God for the harvest.

BORANA:   Pastor Moffat is teaching the Borana and the Somali in the
northeastern side of Kenya to the border with Somalia.  They are recovering from
floods that affected most families.  Most recently, an entire  Muslim family of nine
members gave their lives to Christ.  This was in Gabra after teaching the booklets
and understanding the truths of God.

PAG DENOMINATION:  The PAG is among the larger denominations in Kenya. 
They have gone through all of the initial 68 lessons and are now teaching the
chronological lessons in Acts.  This is the church that has owned the lessons and
has been paying half the price of printing the books.  We just printed 4,000 copies
of Acts to be distributed to 4,000 pastors at their 4,000 churches who will in turn
make copies for their congregations. We estimate an average of 400,000 copies of
Acts lessons will be distributed.  With this, more people will know the truth.

ADC DENOMINATION:  With churches in all the five East African Countries,
ADC has embraced the lessons.  We have launched the lessons in Rwanda and
Burundi.  During our training in Rwanda, one of the pastors said, “This is an eye
opener.  If we had this teaching earlier. we wouldn't have killed each other during
the genocide.  But now we are sure it will never happen again as we now have the
light.”

KUZA DADA INITIATIVE:  This is spearheaded by Bithian in western Kenya
whose aim is to reach out to teenage girls in high schools with the truths through
the lessons.  That which started with five girls is now in seven schools with over
2,000 students studying the lessons every week.  Last year, the teaching ended
with lesson 30 and next week, the schools will open and be ready to continue,
starting with lesson 31.  One of the teachers said this, “When I saw my students
cry as they gave their lives to Christ after the lessons, I felt deep inside me to be
among the right tribe and I was not ashamed to kneel before my students as I also
gave my life to Jesus.”

SOUTH SUDAN:  Our brother Felix has been in South Sudan reaching out to
refugees.  He has been sharing with us how the Lord is using the booklets to touch
lives.  Two witch doctors have surrendered their lives to Christ after going through
the lessons.  So far, we have sent to them booklets in Arabic, Nuer (South Sudan),
and English.  We are trusting God for more this year.



These are but just insights of what is happening in East Africa.  Our prayer is to
have more booklets.  Where man cannot go, these booklets will.




